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HOLY ROSARY CATHOLIC CHURCH                                                                             CEDAR, MI 

Masses, Confessions & Devotions 

  Saturday, June 11th – St. Barnabas (Ember Saturday in the  

  Octave of Pentecost) 

  8:00 Morning Prayer 

  8:10 am OF Mass Int.- Retreat Mass 

  3:00 pm Confession 

  4:00 pm OF Anticipated Mass of THE MOST HOLY  

  TRINITY Int.- For All Parishioners 

 

  Sunday, June 12th – THE MOST HOLY TRINITY (Trinity  

  Sunday) 

  7:25 am–7:50 am Confessions 

  8:00 am OF Mass Int.- Benedikta Kranz & Family by  

  Charles & Sarah Berninger 

  9:15 am OF Retreat Mass Int. – Retreat Families 

  11:00 am EF Mass Int.- Julie Witkowski by the McManus  

  Family 

  4:30 pm Evening Prayer 

   

  Monday, June 13th– St. Anthony of Padua (Both) 

  7:15-7:45 am Confessions; 7:45 am Rosary & Morning Prayer 

  8:15 am OF Mass Int.- Joseph Janik (+) by Irene Janik &  

  Family 

 

  Tuesday, June 14th – Weekday (St. Basil the Great) 

  7:15-7:45 am Confessions; 7:45 am Rosary & Morning Prayer 

  8:15 am OF Mass Int. of Mary Mawby by Ann Mawby 

 

  Wednesday, June 15th– Weekday (St. Vitus & Companions) 

  7:15-7:45 am Confessions; 7:45 am Rosary & Morning Prayer 

  8:15 am OF Mass Int.- Holly Olszewski by the McManus 

  Family 

 

  Thursday, June 16th- Weekday (Corpus Christi) 

  7:45 am Rosary & Morning Prayer 

  8:15 am OF Mass Int.- Special Intention 

  12:00 pm EF Mass Int.- Special Intention 

   

  Friday, June 17th – Weekday (St. Gregory Barbarigo) 

  7:15-7:45 am Confessions; 7:45 am Rosary & Morning Prayer 

  8:15 am OF Mass Int.- Emily Hollabaugh by Kathryn  

  Mousseau 

   

  Saturday, June 18th – Blessed Virgin Mary (St. Ephraem  

  Syrus) 

  7:15-7:45 am Confessions; 7:45 am Rosary & Morning Prayer 

  8:15 am OF Mass Int.- Larry Mousseau (+) 1st Anniversary 

  Of His Death 

  3:00 pm Confession 

  4:00 pm OF Anticipated Mass of THE MOST HOLY BODY  

  & BLOOD OF CHRIST Int.- Germaine Garvin (+) by  

  Larry & Paulette Kubat 

 

  Sunday, June 19th – THE MOST HOLY BODY & BLOOD 

  OF CHRIST (CORPUS CHRISTI) 

  8:00 am OF Mass Int.- For All Parishioners 

  Corpus Christi Procession 

  11:00 am EF Mass Int.- Geneva Watkins 

  4:30 pm Evening Prayer 

 

 

For the Coming Week’s Masses 

4:00 pm OF June 18th  

Propers: David Witkowski  

Cantor:   Abby Repovz 
Lector:    Jason Maday 

Acolyte:  Jason Maday   

Ushers: Bryan Brzezinski; Byron Bolton; Len Zeck; Ron Novak 
 

8:00 am OF June 19th 

Propers: David Witkowski 
Cantor:   Tonya Ratajczak 

Lector: Greg Robinson  
Acolyte: Greg Robinson    

Ushers: Dale Pleva; Fred Peplinski; Time Lowe; Tom Lesausky  

  
11 am EF June 19th  

Ushers: Bill Huddleston; Charles Knapp; Al Garvin; Ryan 
Konieczka, Bernard Zacharias 

 

Corpus Christi Procession and Infiorata 

Join us Sunday, June 19th after the 8am mass for a Eucharistic 
Procession around the grounds and the Infiorata in the church. 

Infiorata means decorated with flowers. The church aisle will be 

decorated with intricate flower petal art that only the priest holding 
our Lord in the Monstrance will walk over.  

 

 

The 25th Annual Life Links Memorial Golf Benefit  

Will be held on Wednesday, July 27th at the Wolverine Golf Course 

at the Grand Traverse Resort. Cost is $150. Players will enjoy 18 
holes of golf, lunch, dinner and a chance to win great prizes, 

including a new car! We are currently seeking businesses and 
individuals to act as outing sponsors. Proceeds benefit Grand 

Traverse Area Right to Life’s educational efforts. For golfer 

registration or information about sponsoring this event, contact the 
Right to Life office at 946-9469 or e-mail director@gmail.com  

 

 

Father’s Day Pen Sale 

The Right to Life will be selling pens after all of the masses on June 

18th and 19th. All proceeds will go to the local area Right to Life. 
 

 

Knights of Columbus- Leelanau Council No. 11664 

A free e-membership is being offered to honor Fr. Michael J. 
McGivney until June 30th. The free online membership code is 

MCGIVNEY2020. Go to kofc.org/joinus and enter in the promo 

code for your free e-membership.  
 

 

CSA 

61% of our parish goal has been met. Thank you for those who have 

already made pledges. Please mail any CSA pledges along with a 
pledge card to the diocese directly or go online to: 

https://dioceseofgaylord.org 

 
 

Catholic Women’s Club 

CWC will be hosting another meeting on June 16th at 7pm. All 

women of the parish are welcome. They are also looking for any 
donation between $5-$10 of crafts, arts, or handmade items for the 

clothes pin booth. Proceeds benefit the church.  

View this bulletin online at www.DiscoverMass.com
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       TRINITY SUNDAY                                                                                     JUNE 12TH, 2022 

 
From Father Libby 

Hello All, Blessed Trinity Sunday! 

      I thought you’d enjoy seeing the letter I put in the time 

capsule that was buried June 7. 
    Dear Pastor of Holy Rosary, 2072 
      The Lord’s Peace! Enjoy the contents of this time capsule. I (Fr 

Donald Libby) have been the pastor of Holy Rosary now from 2009-

2022 (was associate with Fr Michael Janowski from 2007-2009).  I 
arrived when Deacon Muggenburg was the administrator and Fr 

Garth Hilmer would come to say masses basically only on the 
weekends-a bit of a sad state after what had always been a 

flourishing parish with many vocations, religious and for the 

priesthood. The school had closed in 1996, a terrible blow to the 
community amid some question exactly of why it was closing. The 

Felician Nuns had left about 10 years before after all their decades 

of sacrificial service. The Gas Station/convenience store south of 
the parish on what in 2022 is Dave Rosinski’s property disappeared 

before my time and at present, there are on that location only a 
couple old barns (due south), one also kitty corner (southeast), a 

beautiful rental house across the street (due East, Gatzke family’s 

old house. Mike used to come over and ring the angelus bell from 
that house which in my time is mechanized, but we also restored the 

rope to be able to ring it at the consecration), and next to that a red 

house, our only fulltime neighbor (northeast). To the north is 
farmland on both sides of the street, save of course for our 

cemetery. We bought an extra plot to double its size a couple years 
ago; at my time the original cemetery is about 10 years from being 

full. To the south, forest and a pine tree line just behind the grotto 

of Our Lady and our garden, and the old barn (that would be 
interesting to know if the barn is still there at your time—we hope 

so!). Our beautiful new pavilion was just by our new Bishop Jeffrey 
Walsh, sitting just behind the convent/office/adoration chapel 

building (built in 1955).  We’re redoing all the brickwork on the 

school at present—it should be good till you open this capsule but 
you’d better get an assessment on that in 2072, along with the other 

buildings (we did the brick on the Church around 2015—and the 

slate roof on the Church should still be good for quite some time to 
come). The basketball court I would imagine has either been redone 

or replaced (it doubles as our hockey rink).  The old mausoleum-is 
that still there (due north past the soccer field) when I arrived they 

still used it for such sometimes, but now it is a storage building to 

keep the gas away from the other buildings, etc). Hope the septic 
field is still working and all the underground pipes, wires etc; we’ve 

tried to keep maps for you of that. 

       The parish is thriving. Seven kids for confirmation this year 
(usually somewhere around twelve, not bad for a parish that has 

about 120 families that come each week, many more than that ‘on 
the books’). We have two weekend ordinary form masses, 4pm 

Saturday and 8am Sunday (add a 9:25 in the summer).  The 

extraordinary form of the mass (11am) is well attended after Pope 
Benedict XVI asked that it be offered, and Bishop Cooney asked me 

to start it here. This year we have two young men graduating (out of 
eight graduates) interested in the priesthood; David Witkowski just 

got accepted to the diocese and Gabe Maday who will first go to a 

four year college; we also have Jake Belanger who is in college 
seminary. Maybe one of them will be you reading this letter.   

I hope you find this—one parishioner, Trina Pleva (hopefully her 

descendants are still in the parish) mentioned how their class did a 
time capsule, but when they went to dig it up at first no one 

remembered where it was and a road had been built over it. So 
many questions I’d like to ask you, look me up (I’ll be 102); by 2072 

you’ll probably be able to google or whatever exactly what nursing 

home I’m in if I’m not rattling around some parish as the old 
monsignor/associate, or maybe by then they will have longevity pills 

and…I will be reading this letter myself. Keep the faith, and pass on 
the tradition, 

       Busy weekend…family retreat going on so please remember 

the 9:15 mass is for that this weekend (9:15 will start regularly 

soon).  You can still come, but it will be longer than usual.  The 

11am might start a couple minutes late/rosary might need to start 

a bit late. 

Collection Totals for June 4th & June 5th   

OF Masses:       $6,742.00 

EF Masses:                    $1,949.00 

Total:                     $8,691.00 

Choir note 

Men! Please join us in the loft for the offertory on June 26th at the 

11am mass. We will be signing the Ave Maris Stella from the 
Parish Book of Chant. Rehearsals will be on Saturday, June 25th and 

Sunday at 10:30 am. No previous choir experience necessary. 

Contact Luke Altman, John Scott, or Holly for more information. 
 

 

Miles Christi Camp at Holy Rosary  

July 5th-10th Registration is now open for the High School Boys 

Summer Camp. There is a discount of $40, when you use  

“HOLYROSARY” during online registration. 
https://www.mileschristi.org/event/highschool-boys-summer-camp/ 

Other camps for boys and girls will be in Hillsdale. Mileschristi.org  

 
 

FROM THE RAFFLE LADIES 

The raffle tickets are in the back of the church for pickup. Our 

Festival and Raffle is only SEVEN WEEKS AWAY, and our 
EARLY BIRD DRAWING is FIVE WEEKS AWAY. If you 

haven't already, please drop off or send in your prize money ... 

simply drop in one of the boxes; in the back of the church or 
Adoration Chapel waiting area.  If you have questions, you can 

contact Joan Gauthier @ 231-228-6179 or Shirley Mikowski @ 
231-228-3406. A BIG THANK YOU to those who donated prizes, 

and for all of you getting out there and selling tickets....there are 43 

wonderful prizes.  How blessed our Parish is with generosity. Thank 
you all so much for your support! 

 

 

Chant & Art Camp 

Save the Date! Chant & Art camp will be July 18-21st 9am to noon. 

Space is limited to the first 45 students, please email Mrs. 
Olszewski at hollyoski@gmail.com by June 15th to register. 

  

 

~SAVE THE DATE~ 

Mark your calendars for the Holy Rosary Annual Chicken Dinner 

and Festival! Come enjoy the festivities and support our parish 
family! When: SUNDAY, JULY 31, 2022  Dinner served: 11 a.m. - 

4 p.m. All parishioners will be assigned a volunteer shift. If there’s 

a specific area you would like to volunteer, please contact Kate 
Bolton @ (231) 715-9516 or Sarah Grignon @ (231) 392-1999. 

 

 

Graveside Burial Service 

A graveside burial for Randy Brzezinski will be Saturday, June 18, 

11am in the Holy Rosary Church Cemetery. Relatives and friends 
may call on the family at Mt. Calvary Cemetery 10am to 11am prior 

to the service. A luncheon is to follow at the American Legion, 

1231 Hastings St., Traverse City. 

View this bulletin online at www.DiscoverMass.com
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